Bid Tabulation
20-25 "Traffic Signals, Poles, Cabinets, and Accessories™

| | | |
| 1 | 2 | 3 ]
Temple Inc. Utilicom Suj Associates LLC General Electric Equipment Corporation
Product Description Manufacturer(s) Interchangeable/Non-Interchangeable Manufacturer Name/Description Manufacturer No. Manufacturer Name/Description Manufacturer No. Manufacturer Name/Description Manufacturer No.
YELLOW UPPER TWO WAY ARM, PART# SE-5059-P29 PELCO PELCO PART# SE-5059-P29 Pelco SE-5059-P29 GTE TCB-2000
1 $ 110.00 $ 106.00 $ 85.00
HEX NIPPLE, PART# SE-0443-PNC PELCO PELCO PART# SE-0443-PNC Pelco SE-0443-PNC GTE CN-H-150
2 $ 18.00 $ 8.15 $ 7.00
LOCK RING, #SE-0360-PNC PELCO PELCO #SE-0360-PNC Pelco SE-0360-PNC GTE SR-415
3 $ 16.00 $ 5.55 $ 3.00
PELCO PELCO #PB-5100-10 Pelco PB-5100-10 GTE PDP-A-10-40-S
4 PED POLE, # PB-5100-10 PED POLE, 10FT $ 418.00 $ 425.00 $ 365.00
PELCO PELCO # PB-5100-12 Pelco PB-5100-12 GTE PDP-A-12-40-S
5 PED POLE, # PB-5100-12 PED POLE, 10FT $ 474.00 $ 555.00 $ 400.00
Mitchell technology: 578-1 Test Display 578-1 McCain M58800 Mitchell MIT-578-1
6 578-1 Test Display $ 1,096.00 $ 1,455.00 $ 2,600.00
Mitchell technology: 578-2 Test Display 578-2 McCain M58800 Mitchell MIT-578-2
7 578-2 Test Display NO BID $ 1,455.00 $ 2,600.00
PELCO SE-5063-P29 Pelco SE-5063-P29 GTE SWHA-92TS
8 PELSES063-P29. Tri Stud Wire Hanaer Assv. PELCO. $ 96.00 $ 136.00 $ 110.00
Upper & Lower Arm Assy, 2-Way 17" CTC, Cast Tri-Stud, PELCO SE-5061-P29 Pelco SE-5061-P29 GTE TCBA-250
9 Alum/Yellow PELCO $ 153.00 $ 152.00 $ 138.00
PELSE5094-P29, Upper and Lower Arm Assy, 3 Way 17" CTC, PELCO SE-5094-P29 Pelco SE-5094-P29 GTE TCBA-350
10 Cast Tri Stud - Yellow PELCO. $ 252.00 $ 261.00 $ 208.00
11 PELSE-5097-P29, 4 Way upper and lower arm assembly. 17 " PELCO SE-5097-P29 Pelco SE-5097-P29 GTE TCBA-350
ctc . Cast Alum. Yellow PELCO $ 244.00 $ 253.00 $ 238.00
12 PEL SE-3002-P29, Slip Fitter Assy, 1-Way for 4-1/2" OD Ple, PELCO SE-3002-P29 Pelco SE-3002-P29 GTE PTS-110
Alum Yellow_ PELCO $ 95.00 $ 95.00 $ 98.00
Group I: Universal /Traffic Signals Equipment (Cabinets and Electronics etc.) Total: 2.972.00 4,906.70 6.852.00

duct Description Manufacturer(s) it ici e/Descripti Manufacturer No. icing r Name/Description Manufacturer No.

o.:
1 |SUPPORT PLATES. PART#K1188 TEMPLE N Mobotrex K-1188 s 18.00 McCain 120240 s 8.50 GTE RP-TL $ 28.00
2| LED BALLS. 8", RED BALL PART#4331110003XL DIALIGHT N DIALIGHT 4331110003XL s 129.00 Leotek TSL-08R-LX-IL6-AT-P3 | § 50.00 GE LMP-GE-DR4-RTFB-VLA | § 38.00
3 | LED BALLS. 8", YELLOW BALL PART#: DIALIGHT N DIALIGHT 4333130901XL s 129.00 Leotek TSL-08Y-LXIL6-A-P3_|'§ 50.00 GE LMP-GE-DR4-YTFB-VLA | § 38.00
4 [LED BALLS. 8°. GREEN BALL PART 4332120001XL DIALIGHT N DIALIGHT 4332120001XL s 129.00 Leotek TSL-08R-LX-IL6-AT-P3 | S 50.00 GE LMP-GE-DR4-GTFB-VLA | § 38.00
5 [POLY HOUSING. 12", PARTASAT03A1CT1YYY30 MOBOTRAX N Temole SAT03A1CT1YYY30 s 178.00 McCain ith Tunnel Visors M22433/M 19275 s 195.00 GTE T30-POLY $ 175.00
5 |3 SECTION SIGNAL, RED BALL PART# 4331210003XL DIALIGHT DIALIGHT

N 4331210003XL s 122.00 Leotek TSLA2R-LXIL6-ATPE |S 36.00 GE LMP-GE-RTFB-VLA s 38.95
7|3 SECTION SIGNAL, YELLOW BALL PART# 4333230801XL DIALIGHT DIALIGHT
N 4333230901XL H 122.00 Leotek TSL-12Y-LXIL6-A1-P3 _|'§ 36.00 GE LMP-GE-YTFB-VLA $ 38.95
8 |3 SECTION SIGNAL, GREEN BALL, (UNTINT) DIALIGHT N DIALIGHT 4332270001XL s 122.00 Leotek TSL-12G-LX-IL6-A3-P3-CLR | § 36.00 GE LMP-GE-GTFB-VLA $ 38.95
9 [BPASO03ANL, 3 SECTION BACK PLATE N MOBOTRAX BPASO3ANL s 113.00 McCain MB6677 s 12500 GTE BP-A-1003-GTE $ 118.00
BPAS04ANL, 4 SECTION BACK PLATE N MOBOTRAX BPASOAANL s 152.00 McCain M44289 s 155.00 GTE BP-A-1004-GTE 5 138.00
BPASOSHNLOT, 5 SECTION BACK PLATE N MOBOTRAX BPASOSHNLOT s 191.00 McCain ME6592 s 165.00 GTE BP-A-5C-5000 5 285.00
LED 12" SIGNAL Arrow RED BALL DIALIGHT N DIALIGHT LED s 119.00 Leotek TSL-12RA-IL6-AT-P3 | S 40.00 GE LMP-GE-DR6-RTAAN-VIA_| § 45.00
LED 12" SIGNAL Arrow YELLOW BALL DIALIGHT N DIALIGHT LED s 119.00 Leotek TSL-12YAIL6-A1-PS | S 40.00 GE LMP-GE-DR6-YTAAN-VLA | § 45.00
LED 12" SIGNAL Arrow GREEN BALL DIALIGHT N DIALIGHT s 119.00 Leotek TSL-12GA-IL6-A1-P3CLR | § 40.00 GE LMP-GE-DR6-GTAAN-VLA | § 45.00
15__[S6103A2C11YYY30, 12° Alum Housing MOBOTRAX N Temple SG103A2C11YYY30 $ 413.00 McCain with Tunnel Visors M27284/M19278 s 299.00 GTE T30-ALUM $ 235.00
Group II: Signas Equipment (Cabinets and Electronics etc.) Total: | $ 217500 s 1,32550 $ 134485
Group IIl: Cabinets [Traffic Signals Equipment (Cabinets and Electronics etc.)
Product Description Manufacturer(s) Manufacturer Name/Description Manufacturer No. i Manufacturer Name/Description Manufacturer No. Pricing Manufacturer Name/Description Manufacturer No.
1 |LOAD SwiTCH PDC N PDC 558862 NEMA Loadswitch 555863 46.00 PDC 555-88 s 30.00 NO BID NO BID -
2 |TF4008 TERMINAL FACILITY, 12 LS POSITIONS N MOBOTREX TF4008 3,366.00 No Bid No Bid s - NO BID NO BID -
3 [EL712FL BASE MOUNT CABINET N MOBOTREX EL712F 2,656.00 McCain F02 s 13,045.00 NO BID NO BID N
4 |FLASH RELAYS N Temple PAR335 5000 Dunn M11556 s 4000 NO BID NO BID N
5 |NEMAFLASHER N PDC SSF863 SSF863 46.00 McCain/PDC M11373 s 35.00 NO BID NO BID -
6 |SSM-12LEC MONITOR WITH CABLE N EDI; SSM-12LEC: 12 Ch. LCD Enh. NEMA Mon wiE SSM-12LEC s 1.349.00 EDI SSM12LEC s 1.308.00 NO BID NO BID s
7 |LOOP DETECTOR HARNESSES N Digi-Key; ZEW1205 Loop Harness ZEW1205 s 56.00 McCain M17502 s 40.00 NOBID NOBID S
EDI:LMD301T; Single Ch. Shelf Det. w/
8 |EDI LMD301T DETECTORS N LMD301T s 286.00 McCain/ED! M17501 s 22000 NOBID NOBID $ =
9 |EL70452 POLE MOUNT CABINET Mobotrex:EL70452: Cabinet M-36 Pole Mounted: EL70452 s 2.259.00 McCain FO2PM s 12.665.00 NO BID NO BID s
10752 Detectors ORACLEAJE Detector N Mobotrex/Oracl Oracle 4le s 451.00 EDI ORACLEAE s 443.00 NO BID NO BID S
11 |TS2 CARD RACK ASSEMBLY N Mobotrex CDR100 s 312.00 No Bid No Bid s - NO BID NO BID S
12| TE5116AL TERMINAL FACILITY N Mobotrex TF5116AL s 3,113.00 No Bid No Bid s NOBID NOBID S
EDI; MMU216-LE; 16 Ch. LCD enhanced TS2
13 |MMU16-LE Monitor with Cable N Smart MMU216-LE s 1.376.00 EDI MMU2-16LE s 1,425.00 NOBID NOBID $ =
TS1 Eight (8) Phase Pole Mount Cab Assembly to include:
EPAC3108M62 Controller
TF4008 Terminal Facility
12 LS Positions
EL704S2 Pole Mount Cabinet
(12) Load Switches,
(4) Flash Relays,
NEMA Flasher,
MMU16-LE Monitor with Cable,
(12) Loop Detector Harnesses (No Detectors Included)
14 N Temple (8) Phase Pole Mount | § 14,582.00 No Bid No Bid s - NOBID NOBID $ -
TS2 Sixeteen (16) PHASE POLE MOUNT CAB ASSEMBLY
INCLUDING:
EPAC3108M62 CONTROLLER
TF5116AL TERMINAL FACILITY
16 LS POSITIONS
EL704S2 POLE MOUNT CABINET
(16) LOAD SWITCHES
(6) FLASH RELAYS NEMA FLASHER
MMU16-LE MONITOR WITH CABLE
15 752 CARD RACK ASSEMBLY N Temple (16) Phase Pole Mount | § 17,373.00 No Bid No Bid s - NOBID NOBID $ -
TS1 Sixteen (16) Phase Base Mount Cabinet Assembly to
include:
EPAC3108M62 Controller
TF4116MT2 Terminal Facilty
16 LS Positions
EL712FL Base Mount Cabinet
(16) Load Switches
(4) Flash Relays, NEMA Flasher
MMU16-LE Monitor with Cable
(12) Loop Detector Harnesses (No Detectors Included)
16 N Temple (16) Phase Base Mount | § 15,421.00 No Bid No Bid s - NOBID NOBID $ -
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NEMA 16 Phase Base Mount Cabinet TS2 Type 1 Meets
17__|aLoot N Temple NEMA (16) Phase Base Mount | § 13.695.00 McCain FO2ASSEMBL s 19.575.00 NO BID NO BID s -
18 [NEMA 16 Phase Pole Mount Cabinet Tvoe 1 N Temole NEMA (16) Phase Base Mount | § 13.332.00 McCain FO3ASSEMBL s 19.255.00 NO BID NOBID $ -
19 [BIU700 N Mobotrex BIU 700 s 391.00 EDI BIU-700 s 368.00 NO BID NO BID $ -
20| Cabinet Power Supolv TS2 Cabinet N Mobotrex CPS105 s 456.00 EDI PS250 s 618.75 NO BID NO BID s -
21| Main Line Arrestor for TS2 Cabinet N HE1750R HE1750R s 138.00 No Bid No Bid s - NO BID NO BID $ -
22 |NEMA CONTROLLER. PART# EPAC3108M62 SEIMENS Seimens EPAC3108M62 s 4.337.00 No Bid No Bid s - NO BID NO BID $ -
COBALT C Controller, Shelf Mount, EOS Software
23 _[C0BC20100000000000 ECONOLITE NO BID $ - No Bid No Bid s - NO BID NO BID $ -
Group Ill Cabinets: Signal d Electronics etc.) Total: | § 95,001.00 s 69,067.75 s -
Total Amount o Bid | § 100,238.00 75,299.95 | § 8,196.85
Delivery i teed not later than __days after order date. days 45-60 days 30 days
Guaranteed maximum discount available if Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd year %
0% 0% 0%
Guaranteed maximum discount available if Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd year %
0% 0% 0%
Required Forms
Temple Inc. Utilicom Supply Associates LLC General Electric Equipment Corporation

Experience Statement Yes Yes Yes

Notification of Intent to Respond Yes Yes Yes

Non-Collusion Affidavit Yes Yes Yes

Affdavit of Contractor Yes Yes Yes

Jefferson County, Alabama Equal Employment Opportunity (EEOC) Certification Form Yes Yes Yes

Debarment Statement Yes Yes Yes

Statement of Compliance with alabama Code Section 31-13-9 Yes Yes Yes

Sianature Page Yes Yes Yes
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Vendor Contact Information

Bidder 1:

Temple Inc.

Contact:

Delilah Mitchell, Sales Support

Address:

305 Bank St. Decatur, Alabama 35601

Ph:

Phone: 1-800-633-3221 \ Fax: 1-256-353-4578\ Email: delilah.mitchell@temple-inc.com

Bidder 2:

Utilicom Supply Associates LLC

Contact:

Tammy Coggins, Chief Estimator

Address:

4400 Shackleford Road Norcross, GA 30093

Ph:

Phone: 1-205-995-2855 \ Email: tcoggins@utilicomsupply.com

Bidder 3:

General Traffic Equipment Corporation

Contact:

Raymond Stoffin, President

Address:

259 Broadway Newburgh, New York 12550

Ph:

Phone: 1-800-633-3221 \ Fax: 1-256-353-4578
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